

**City of Rock Island, Illinois**

**Department: Fire**

**Job Name: 2020 COVID-19 PPE Purchase (FEMA AFG Grant)**

**Bid Date: 26 October 2020**



**Bid Tabulation**

<b>Bidder</b>	<b>N95 Masks (1500)</b>	<b>Medical Masks (9500)</b>	<b>Gowns (1500)</b>	<b>Safety Glasses (575)</b>
Ever Ready First Aid	4500 (3.00/unit)	1710 (0.18/unit)	3810 (2.54/unit)	1253.5 (2.18/unit) [goggles]
LFB3	4275 (2.85/unit)	1425 (0.15/unit)	2220 (1.48/unit)	948.75 (1.65/unit)
KWEST Sourcing	2850 (1.90/unit)	855 (0.09/unit) 09-29-2020 1045 (0.11/unit) 11-06-2020	1860 (1.24/unit) 09-29-2020 3555 (2.37) 11-06-2020	No Bid
Sports Brand Group	6375 (4.25/unit)	1900 (0.20/unit)	2250 (1.50/unit)	No Bid
Unipak Corp.	5100 (3.40/unit) [?] 4200 (2.80/unit) [Makrite 9500]	855 (0.09/unit)	2850 (1.90/unit) 3600 (2.40/unit)	1638.75 (2.85/unit) [goggles]
Accumed Biotech	6750 (4.50/unit)	2850 (0.30/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
DG Auto Wreckers	4200 (2.80/unit) [L-188] 4650 (3.10/unit) [L-288]	1425 (0.15/unit) [Level 1]	2475 (1.65/unit) [Level 1]	No Bid
Legacy Medical Sales	7470 (4.98/unit)	2755 (0.29/unit)	4125 (2.75/unit)	No Bid
Premium Contractor Solutions	4425 (2.95/unit)	1282.50 (0.135/unit)	2550 (1.70/unit)	575 (1.00/unit)
Moss	No Bid	950 (0.10/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Garvey's Office Products	7536 (5.02/unit)	1702.40 (0.18/unit) [disposable] 2827.20 (0.2976/unit) [medical]	6960 (4.64/unit)	684.25 (1.19/unit)
Linstol	No Bid	6365 (0.67/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Fastenal	2594.34 (1.73/unit)	5225 (0.55/unit)	4485 (2.99/unit)	429.30 (0.747/unit)
LMS Brandz	5850 (3.90/unit)	2375 (0.25/unit)	4725 (3.15/unit)	1995.25 (3.47/unit)
EWB Tech	No Bid	1425 (0.15/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Intco Medical	No Bid	285 (0.03/unit)	1800 (1.20/unit)	No Bid
Taza Supplies	3000 (2.00/unit) [KN95]	4655 (0.49/unit)	15300 (10.20/unit)	1207.50 (2.10/unit)
GIMDx	No Bid	1615 (0.17/unit)	No Bid	5.75 (0.01/unit)
Uwepport	No Bid	2194 (0.231/unit)	3375 (2.25/unit) [Level 1]	1437.50 (2.50/unit) [goggles]
Medzon Health	6375 (4.25/unit)	1045 (0.11/unit)	2250 (1.50/unit)	3162.50 (5.50/unit)
Planet Halo	2235 (1.49/unit)	665 (0.07/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
White Cap	836.25 (0.56/unit) [3M 8210]	4446 (0.47/unit)	4425 (2.95/unit)	414 (0.72/unit)
Spectrum Medical	6375 (4.25/unit)	712.50 (0.075/unit)	4425 (2.95/unit)	2846.25 (4.95/unit)
Air One	No Bid	No Bid	4425 (2.95/unit)	3018.75 (5.25/unit)

**City of Rock Island, Illinois**

**Department: Fire**

**Job Name: 2020 COVID-19 PPE Purchase (FEMA AFG Grant)**

**Bid Date: 26 October 2020**



**Bid Tabulation**

<b>Bidder</b>	<b>N95 Masks (1500)</b>	<b>Medical Masks (9500)</b>	<b>Gowns (1500)</b>	<b>Safety Glasses (575)</b>
US Health Express (Jointown)	4800 (3.20/unit)	760 (0.08/unit)	3000 (2.00/unit)	633 (1.10/unit) [goggles]
Centric	No Bid	1520 (0.16/unit)	2550 (1.70/unit)	No Bid
Cano Group	No Bid	No Bid	5625 (3.75/unit) [size XL]	No Bid
Med Shield	No Bid	1510.50 (0.159/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Liberty Paper	No Bid	1425 (0.15/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Avante	No Bid	No Bid	3375 (2.25/unit) [Level 2]	No Bid
BSN Sports	No Bid	8455 (0.89/unit)	14070 (9.38/unit) [Level 2]	No Bid
IMT	No Bid	2755 (0.29/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Fortes Health	4875 (3.25/unit)	1900 (0.20/unit)	4875 (3.25/unit) [Level 2]	718.75 (1.25/unit) [goggles]
N95 Medical Supplies	3600 (2.40/unit)	475 (0.05/unit)	5625 (3.75/unit)	No Bid
Spirit Sanitizer	6000 (4.00/unit)	370.50 (0.039/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Treetop Enterprises	3075 (2.05/unit) [84A-7638]	2375 (0.25/unit) [CA]	5400 (3.60/unit)	2472.50 (4.30/unit)
	4200 (2.80/unit) [84A-5411]	2090 (0.22/unit) [China]		
ASE, Inc.	5775 (3.85/unit)	1596 (0.168/unit)	3630 (2.42/unit) [Level 2]	1423.13 (2.48/unit)
Miniwing Health	5250 (3.50/unit)	950 (0.10/unit) [Level 1]	2250 (1.50/unit) [SMS]	2012.50 (3.50/unit)
		2850 (0.30/unit) [Level 2]	3375 (2.25/unit) [Level 1]	
Concordance HS	1845 (1.23/unit)	3562.50 (0.375/unit)	4500 (3.00/unit)	805 (1.40/unit)
Abel Unlimited	3920 (2.45/ unit - QTY 1600)	1000 (0.10/unit - QTY 10000)	3375 (2.25/unit)	450 (0.75/unit - QTY 600)
GBMP	7500 (5.00/unit) [FM-3]	4066 (0.428/unit) [FM-5B]	6960 (4.64/unit) [DG-2]	2817.50 (4.90/unit) [goggles]
	7500 (5.00/unit) [FM-3B]	3534 (0.372/unit) [FM-4]		
	7500 (5.00/unit) [FM-3G]			
ASA Techmed	4500 (3.00/unit) [Makrite 9500]	1330 (0.14/unit) [Level 1]	2625 (1.75/unit)	No Bid
	2850 (1.90/unit) [Makrite Sekura]	665 (0.07/unit) [disposable]		
PCCS Medical	6000 (4.00/unit)	1140 (0.12/unit)	12660 (8.44/unit)	No Bid
Protex Labs	No Bid	855 (0.09/unit)	2025 (1.35/unit)	
Texas Medical Center Supply	5625 (3.75/unit)	2375 (0.25/unit)	2850 (1.90/unit) [Level 1]	1725 (3.00/unit) [goggles]
Medica	3675 (2.45/unit) [Harley L-188]	1425 (0.15/unit)	2175 (1.45/unit)	3346.50 (5.82/unit) [goggles]
	3375 (2.25/unit) [Sanitek]			
Occupational Training	1646.25 (1.10/unit) [3M 8210]	2755 (0.29/unit)	39375 (26.25/unit) [Level 1]	776.25 (1.35/unit)

**City of Rock Island, Illinois**

**Department: Fire**

**Job Name: 2020 COVID-19 PPE Purchase (FEMA AFG Grant)**

**Bid Date: 26 October 2020**



**Bid Tabulation**

<b>Bidder</b>	<b>N95 Masks (1500)</b>	<b>Medical Masks (9500)</b>	<b>Gowns (1500)</b>	<b>Safety Glasses (575)</b>
	2475 (1.65/unit) [3M 8210V]			
LNJ Capital	2250 (1.50/unit)	931 (0.098/unit)	5250 (3.50/unit)	920 (1.60/unit)
CW Horizon	4350 (2.90/unit) [3M 8210]	1995 (0.21/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
	4125 (2.75/unit) [Makrite 9500]			
PELV-ICE	No Bid	760 (0.08/unit)	2220 (1.48/unit)	No Bid
CEI	3870 (2.58/unit)	456 (0.048/unit)	2685 (1.79/unit)	1420.25 (2.47/unit) [goggles]
Invi Bridge	2025 (1.35/unit) [3M 9501]	1425 (0.15/unit)	3585 (2.39/unit)	690 (1.20/unit) [goggles]
My Medical	No Bid	361 (0.038/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Rescue Essentials	No Bid	3420 (0.36/unit)	4650 (3.10/unit)	No Bid
Intercontinental	2835 (1.89/unit)	475 (0.05/unit)	4725 (3.15/unit)	1719.25 (2.99/unit)
BE Industries	5775 (3.85/unit)	1425 (0.15/unit)	2625 (1.75/unit)	No Bid
Tricol	No Bid	1140 (0.12/unit)	No Bid	No Bid
Yates Protect	9300 (6.20/unit)	4655 (0.49/unit)	3975 (2.65/unit)	1029.25 (1.79/unit)
PWG	No Bid	1710 (0.18/unit)	4125 (2.75/unit)	No Bid
Bound Tree	4713.86 (3.14/unit)	No Bid	4723.50 (3.149/unit)	718.75 (1.25/unit)
Great Hawk	4320 (2.88/unit)	7600 (0.80/unit)	5250 (3.50/unit)	4887.50 (8.50/unit)
Conney	2163 (1.442/unit) [KN95]	3610 (0.38/unit)	No Bid	350.75 (0.61/unit)
Queen of Safety	8625 (5.75/unit)	9025 (0.95/unit)	7425 (4.95/unit)	977.50 (1.70/unit) [frame&lens]
Global PPE	3375 (2.25/unit)	1140 (0.12/unit)	2400 (1.60/unit)	822.25 (1.43/unit) [goggles]

**Bids Awarded as Follows:**

N95 Masks	HD Supply (White Cap)
Medical Masks	ASA Techmed
Gowns	ASA Techmed
Safety Glasses	HD Supply (White Cap)

**Bids Highlighted in Red were Rejected**